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To: Sen. Bailey, Rep. Perry, and esteemed members of the Health Coverage, Insurance, and 
Financial Services Committee 
Re: Support for LD 227, An Act Regarding Health Care in the State 
 

My name is Kris Pitts, and I am a taxpayer and resident of Lewiston, ME. I am writing to strongly urge 
you to find Ought to Pass in favor of LD 227, An Act Regarding Health Care in the State. 
 

As a professional with a career spanning over twenty-five years of service to youth, young adults, 
individuals, and families who have experienced significant medical and health disparities, I have 
seen the very real and life-saving outcomes associated with protecting the rights of healthcare 
professionals and their patients to make decisions based in what is in the best interest of the 
patient at that time, and what decision the patient will still feel good about in one week, and six 
months, and two years down the road… These are not decisions states -or other citizens- should be 
making for these patients; this includes minors when discussing care which they have the legal 
right to access individually (reproductive healthcare after a certain age, physical and mental 
healthcare when qualified through McKinney-Vento, etc.). 
 
Additionally, we should be applauding all efforts to safeguard medical records and ensure patient 
privacy, and it would be a gross misstep to fail to recognize that it is not uncommon for folks of all 
ages to travel to other states to seek medical care of all kinds. As a member of multiple 
LGBTQAI2S+ communities, I also deeply understand the difference having safe, supportive, and 
understanding adults and providers can make in the life of a young person. Having one’s chosen 
name and correct pronouns used is associated with a 29% decrease in suicidal ideation, as well as 
a 56% decrease in suicidal behavior.4 Whether it is a parent, guardian, or other safe and supportive 
adult, supporting young people in accessing gender-affirming care is suicide prevention and we 
have already lost too many members of our communities to irrational hate and injustice. 
 

Fearmongering around lifesaving and heavily regulated medical practices such as gender affirming 
care and abortion (gender affirming surgical procedures -which are only one part of gender 
affirming care, yet are seemingly the focus of tremendous concern- having a 1% regret rate1 as 
compared to the 22% regret rate2 associated with total knee replacement surgery, or the 95% of 
those opting for abortion who believe they made the correct decision3 post-procedure), combined 
with a lack of understanding by some surrounding the contents of LD 227, is no reason to fail to 
support this bill; I strongly urge you to take just action and fully support LD 227, keeping Maine on 
the correct side of history in this matter. 
 

In community, 
 

 
 

Kris Pitts, MPS, MSW 
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